: REDWOOD VALLEY-CALPELLA FIRE DISTRICT

e Delbert Phelps Fire House

oY
ﬁé z?\‘é e 8481 East Road
. «ﬁ Redwood Valley CA 95470

g pee; Phone: 707-485-8121
: www.redwoodvalleycalpellafire.org

BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Joe Cooper Stephanie Dunken Ryan Mayfield Russel Odell James Tuso

REGULAR MEETING AGENDA

Thursday, August 14, 2025 at 6:00PM

Any person who requires a disability related modification or accommodation in order to participate
in a public meeting should make such a request to Jessica Keizer, Board Clerk, for immediate
consideration.

Opening Business
1.1 Call to Order

1.2 Pledge of Allegiance and Moment of Silence
1.3 Roll Call

Public Comment (GC §54954.3)

This portion of the meeting is reserved for persons wishing to address the Board on any matter not on
the agenda. Any matter that requires Board action will be referred to staff for a report and action at a
subsequent Board meeting.

Agenda Amendments (GC §54954.2) — Discussion/Action

Consent Calendar

(Consent calendar items will be enacted upon by one motion. There will be no separate discussion
on items unless a Board Member, Staff, or member of the public requests removal of the item for
separate action.)

4.1  Minutes: Approve Regular Board Meeting Minutes of July 10, 2025

4.2 Payroll: Approve Payroll 13, and 14 in the amount of: $53,337.72
4.3  Expenditures: Approve Expenditures for July in the Amount of:
General Fund with CalCard Details: $108,256.58

Action Items — Discussion/Action
5.1  Review and Adopt a Resolution Acknowledging Acceptance of a Report on the District’s
Compliance with SB1205 and California Health and Safety Code Section 13146.4 (State
Mandated Inspections) - Discussion/Action
Page 1 of 2
Agenda Posted Per Government Code Section §54954.2



10.

11.

5.2 Introduction and Waive the Reading of Ordinance 2025-02, an Ordinance of the Redwood
Valley-Calpella Fire District, Adopting the 2025 Edition of the California Fire Code part 9 and
the 2025 Edition of the California Wildland-Urban Interface Code part 7 with amendments,
and Direct Staff to Set a Public Hearing to Adopt the Ordinance at the Next Regular Board of
Directors Meeting, September 11, 2025 - Discussion/Action

5.3  Public Hearing: Review and Approve the Final Budget for fiscal year 2025/26 per California
Health and Safety Code Section 13890 - Discussion/Action

5.4  Review and Approve the County of Mendocino Fire Agency Funding Agreement for the
Allocation of Measure P, Measure D and Proposition 172 Revenues for Quarter 3 of Fiscal
Year 2024-2025-Discussion/Action

Measure P = $60,689.40
Measure D (TOT) = $ 2,499.97
Proposition 172 = $ 5,581.66

5.5 Review and Approve a New Copier/Printer Lease Agreement - Discussion/Action
5.6 Outdoor Warning Siren — Draft Operating Procedure (OPM 3.24) — Discussion/Action

Board of Directors and Administrative Reports — Information/Discussion
(No action will be taken on any questions raised by the Board at this time.)
6.1  Board of Directors Report

Human Resources Committee (Ad Hoc — Dunken and Odell)

Budget Committee (Standing — Dunken and Odell)

6.2  Fire Chief Report
6.3  Volunteers Reports (Fire Marshal, Training Officer and Safety Officer)
6.4  Volunteer Association Report

Correspondence — Information
7.1  Thank you letter for dog rescue

7.2 Thank you note for jack rabbit recovery
Request for Future Agenda Items

Closed Session: Government Code §54957
9.1  Fire Chief Recruitment: Government Code §54957.(b)(1)

9.2 Interim Fire Chief Performance Review: Government Code §54957.(b)(1)

Open Session
10.1 Report on Closed Session: Government Code §54957.1

Adjournment

Next Regularly Scheduled Board Meeting
Thursday, September 11. 2025 at 6 p.m.

Page 2 of 2
Agenda Posted Per Government Code Section §54954.2





















Monthly Disbursements

Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District

July 1-30, 2025

Date Num Vendor Memo Amount
07/02/2025 3657 AT&T Station Phone Lines -132.51
07/02/2025 3658 City of Ukiah Fleet Repairs -3,188.32
07/02/2025 3659 Southern Tire Mart, LLC Steer Tires - E6261 -1,093.94
07/02/2025 3660 Special District Risk Management Authority Employee Health Insurances -2,028.89
07/02/2025 3661 Special District Risk Management Authority Annual Workers Compensation Insurance -38,145.02
07/08/2025 3662 City of Ukiah Station Water -55.00
07/08/2025 3663 Curtis Tools PPE - 50% reimbursed by Vol. Assoc. -29,747.61
07/08/2025 3664 George Petersen Insurance Agency Quarterly Liability, Property and Vehicle Ins. -6,173.00
07/08/2025 3665 Mendocino County Auditor-Controller Property Tax Collection Fees -7,289.00
07/08/2025 3666 Napa Auto Parts Repair Parts -28.29
07/08/2025 3667 Nick Barbieri Trucking Diesel Fuel -1,667.72
07/08/2025 3668 S&L Controller Services Accounting Services -1,660.10
07/08/2025 3669 United States Postal Service Post Office Box Annual Rental -188.00
07/23/2025 3675 PG&E Station Electric and Gas -1,544.36
07/23/2025 3676 PNP CPA Annual Audit Engagement -2,600.00
07/23/2025 3677 Ricoh USA, Inc. Copier/Printer Lease/Use -224.20
07/23/2025 3678 Speedy Signs WT 6291 Lettering/Numbering/Striping -2,185.76
07/23/2025 3679 State of California Department of Justice Live Scan Fees -49.00
07/30/2025 3680 AT&T Station Phone Lines -132.96
07/30/2025 3681 Print Your Mitts Live Scan Fees -30.00
07/30/2025 3682 Special District Risk Management Authority Employee Health Insurances -2,002.33
07/30/2025 U.S. Bank See attached details -8,090.57

Total -$108,256.58
07/17/2025 3670 Ricoh USA, Inc. Voided Check 0.00
07/17/2025 3671 Speedy Signs Voided Check 0.00
07/17/2025 3672 PNP CPA Voided Check 0.00
07/17/2025 3673 State of California Department of Justice Voided Check 0.00
07/17/2025 3674 Speedy Signs Voided Check 0.00




CAL-Card July 2025 Charges

Vendor Descriptioon Amount [Budget Code |
Redwood Valley Market Raid/Wasp Nest Spray $9.70 86-2090|
Lindberg Lumber Epoxy for Ipad Mounts $8.40 86-2120
Redwood Valley Station Propane for forklift $37.01 86-2250
Solid Waste Solutions Dump Fees $26.00 86-2090
O'Reilly New eraser wheel for buffer $40.98 86-2120
Amazon PAID Stamp $22.54 86-2170
Google Google Workspace Monthly Billing $100.80 86-2170
Redwood Waste Solutions Monthly garbage service $128.24 86-2090
Costco Annual Costco Membership $65.00 86-2150
Streamline Website-RVCFD Monthly $206.00 86-2170
AT&T District Cell Phone and Tablets+(Activation Fees) $366.56 86-2060
Comcast/Xfinoty Internet-Monthly $92.00 86-2170
Costco Liquid IV Hydration powder for station $83.96 86-2080
Powerwerx Tablet/Ipad fast charger for 6261 & 6281 $118.84 86-2220
Mendo Mill Mounting hardware for fire danger sign $37.58 86-2130
Coyote Valley Gas Fuel-6200 $81.50 86-2250
LN Curtis Wheels choc and suction strainer for WT6291 $1,463.63 86-4370
Santa Rosa Uniform Nomex Uniform Shirt-Grebil $241.40 86-2050
Mendo Mill 2-Parking blocks/3-Waspl/yellow jacket traps $161.76 86-2130
BK Fire Radios Portable Radio Repair Parts $45.95 86-2120
LN Curtis Hydrant and Spaner Wrench Set WT6291 $400.06 86-4370
Coyote Valley Gas Fuel-6200 $96.00 86-2250
Mob Armour Tablet/Ipad mounting accessories $43.13 86-2120
Harbor Freight 2nd Power Washer $97.08 86-2220
Coyote Valley Gas Fuel 6200 $53.00 86-2250
Fire Manufacturing Innovations |Slide Out Trays X 2 WT6291 $2,652.25 86-4370
Coyote Valley Gas Fuel-6200 $104.00 86-2250
Staples Steno notepads X12/Pens $48.97 86-2170
Mendo Mill Returned Electrical Plug -$12.93 86-2120
Mendo Mill Electrical Plug end for engine power cord $12.93 86-2120
Mendo Mill Electrical Plug end for power cord 6267/Quick Co $31.26 86-2120
Elite Command Training Instructor 1 Training-Robinson $470.00 86-2187
Larkspur Ext Stay Suites Lodging for Instructor 1 Training-Robinson $499.48 86-2187
Mendo Mill No Flat Tire-Wheel Barrow $59.32 86-2130
Redwood Valley Station Propane for forklift $32.29 86-2250
Garmin Annual Mapping Subscription GPS $49.99 86-2239
Costco Toilet Paper/Bath Towels/Paper Towels/Cleaner $115.89 86-2090
Total Charges: $8,090.57
Budget Totals:
86-2050 PPE $241.40
86-2060 Telephone/Communication $366.56
86-2080 Food $83.96
86-2090 Household $279.83
86-2120 Maint/Repair-Vehicles $169.72
86-2130 Building Maint $258.66
86-2150 Memberships $65.00
86-2170 Supplies-Office $470.31
86-2187 Training $969.48
86-2220 Small Tools $215.92
86-2239 Special Dept Expense $49.99
86-2250 Travel/Transportation/Gas $403.80
86-4370 Fixed Assets (New F/A Water Tender 6291) $4,515.94
Total: $5,090.57



















ATTACHMENT1

ORDINANCE NO. 20253-2+

AN ORDINANCE OF THE REDWOOD VALLEY-CALPELLA FIRE DISTRICT
ADOPTING THE 20252 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE_PART 9 WITH
AMENDMENTS, AS WELL AS THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE, PART 7NFRPA—1 CHAPTER 38,
REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY
FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION AND FOR PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF
PERMITS, REPEALING ALL OTHER ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF ORDINANCES
OF THE REDWOOD VALLEY-CALPELLA FIRE DISTRICT IN CONFLICT
HEREWITH.

The Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District does ordain as follows:

Part 1. That the California Fire Code, 20252 edition, including Appendix Chapter 4 and
Appendices B, BB, C, CC, D, E, F, G, H, I, K, N, and O as published by the International Code
Council, as well as the 2025 edition of the California Wildland-Urban Interface Code (WUI),
including Appendix A, B, and F as published by the International Code CouncilNFRA-L-Chapter
38, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District in the
State of California regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials
and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and
premises as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore;
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire Code
on file in the office of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District are hereby referred to, adopted,
and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions

and changes if any, prescrlbed in Part 2 of thls Ordlnance —Fu#he#tkmegulaﬂens—@wwnaﬂhe

Part 2. That the following sections of the 2025 edition of the California Wildland-Urban Interface
Code are hereby amended and changed in the following respects:

Section 101.1 Title of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
101.1 Title. These requlations shall be known as the California Wildland-Urban Interface
Code of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section 103.1 Creation of agency. The Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District is hereby
created, and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the Fire Code Official. The
function of this agency shall be the implementation, administration, and enforcement of
the provisions of this code.




That the following sections of the 20252 edition of the California Fire Code are hereby amended
and changed in the following respects:

Section 101.1 Title of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Redwood Valley-
Calpella Fire District, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section 105.1 General of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
105.1 General. Permits shall be in accordance with Sections 105.1.1 through 105.7.25 or
other provisions of this code as required by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District.

Section 1121-9 Board of Appeals Established of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
1121.19 Board of Appeals Established. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders,
decisions or determinations made by the fire code official relative to the application and
interpretation of this code, there shall be and is hereby created a Board of Appeals. The
Board of Appeals shall be the Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire
District or a sub-committee as appointed by the Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-
Calpella Fire District. The fire code official shall be an ex-officio member of said board
but shall have no vote on any matter before the board. The board shall adopt rules of
procedure for conducting its business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing
to the Appellant with a duplicate copy to the fire code official.

Section 112%.3 Qualifications of Chapter 1 is deleted.

Section 1121.54 Appeals Process of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

112.569:3 Appeals Process. The appeals process for appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the fire code official relative to the application and interpretation
of this code shall be defined by sections 1121.54.1 through 1121.54.5.

Section 1121.54.1 Initiating Appeal of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

Section 1121.54.1 Initiating Appeal. Any beneficially interested party has the right to
appeal the order served by the fire code official by filing a written “NOTICE OF APPEAL”
with the office of the fire code official within ten days after service of such order and upon
payment of the sum of $150. In the event the order of the fire code official is overturned
following the appeal, the fee shall be returned. The notice shall state the order appealed
from, the identity and mailing address of the Appellant, and the specific grounds upon
which the appeal is made.

Section 1121.54.2 Stay of Order of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

Section 1121.54.2 Stay of Order. The timely filing of a properly completed notice of
appeal shall have the effect of staying the implementation of the order appealed from until
the final decision of the appeal. Failure to file a timely notice of appeal waives any right
to further challenge the order of the fire code official. “File” means delivered to the office
of the fire code official at 8481 East Rd, Redwood Valley, California 95470.



Exception: Orders affecting acts or conditions which in the opinion of the fire code
official, pose an immediate threat to life, property, or the environment as a result of panic,
fire, explosion, or release are enforceable when made and are not stayed by the filing of a
notice of appeal.

Section 1121.54.3 Hearing of Appeal of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:
Section 1121.54.3 Hearing of Appeal. Following is the process for establishing and
hearing appeals:

The Board of Appeals, or the secretary thereof, shall set the matter to be heard at a date
within thirty (30) days of receipt of such notice of appeal. Written notice of the time and
place set for hearing shall be served on the Appellant by first class mail to the mailing
address given in the notice of appeal. A hearing may not be conducted less than 20 days
after notice is given to the applicant. The Board of Appeals may adopt rules governing the
conduct of its hearings. Those rules shall include, at least, the following:

1. The fire code official shall submit evidence at the hearing substantiating his/her
decision. Such evidence may include testimony, fire district, police or other reports of the
incident, witness statements, and other documents. Not less than 10 days prior to the
scheduled hearing, the fire code official must notify the Appellant of the name, address and
phone number of any witness to the violation and furnish Appellant with a copy of any
document the fire code official intends to submit at the hearing. Not less than seven (7)
days prior to the hearing, the Appellant may request the fire code official to produce at the
hearing any witness he/she intends to rely upon to substantiate the violation. The written
request must name the witness or witnesses who are requested to attend the hearing. The
fire code official may not rely on the testimony of any witness (including such testimony
contained in reports or written witness statements) whose appearance at the hearing is
required by this subsection, if that witness fails to appear.

2. Not less than 10 days prior to the hearing, the Appellant must notify the fire code official
in writing of the name, address and phone number of any witness the Appellant intends to
call as a witness at the hearing, provide a brief description of the proposed testimony, and
furnish the fire code official with a copy of any document the Appellant intends to offer as
evidence at the hearing. The Appellant may not call any witness to testify at the hearing
who was not identified as required by this subsection or offer any document as evidence at
the hearing that was not provided to the fire code official as required by this subsection.

3. Atthe hearing, the Appellant may be represented by an attorney, at Appellant’s expense.
Both the fire code official and the Appellant shall have the right to examine and cross-
examine any witness produced at the hearing. The rules of evidence that normally apply
in court shall not apply in a hearing before the Board of Appeals, but it shall only consider
evidence which would be relied upon by reasonable people making an important decision,
and shall disregard evidence which by its nature is unreliable or not credible.

4. The entire hearing shall be electronically or steno graphically recorded. The Board of
Appeals shall base its decision exclusively on the evidence presented at the hearing and



shall issue a written decision, which includes a statement of the relevant facts which it finds
to be true and explains how the facts support its decision. The record of the hearing shall
be preserved for not less than six (6) months after the decision is served on the Appellant.

Section 112%1.54.4 Hearing Decision of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

Section 1121.54.4 Hearing Decision. The chairperson of the Board of Appeals shall issue
the written decision required by subsection 4 of Section 1121.4.3 Hearing of appeal. The
Board of Appeals may issue a decision affirming, modifying or vacating the order of the
fire code official. The decision shall be in writing and shall be served upon the Appellant
by first class mail to the mailing address given in the notice of appeal. The hearing decision
shall include notice of the Appellant’s right to seek review of the decision pursuant to
California Code of Civil Procedure Sections 1094.5 and 1094.6.

Section 1121.54.5 Finality of the Decision of the Board of Appeals of Chapter 1 is added
to read as follows:

Section 1121.54.5 Finality of the Decision of the Board of Appeals. The decision of the
Board of Appeals shall be the final decision for the District. The Board of Appeals shall
have the power to continue any hearing and may, in its discretion, take the appeal under
submission. The Board of Appeals shall render a decision not later than the seventh (7™
day following the date the matter was taken under submission, and forthwith notify the
interested parties as previously set forth.

Section 1121.54.6 Appeal to Superior Court of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:
Section 1121.54.6 Appeal to Superior Court. Judicial review of the decision of the Board
of Appeals shall be governed by the Code of Civil Procedure Sections 1094.5 and 1094.6.

Section 1121.54.7 Enforcement of Decision of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:
Section 1121.54.7 Enforcement of Decision. Unless stayed by a court, any final decision
of the Board of Appeals is effective immediately and may be implemented and enforced
by the District. The remedies provided by this code are cumulative and in addition to any
other remedies available at law or in equity.

1. Causing, permitting, aiding, abetting, or concealing a violation of any provision of this
ordinance shall constitute a violation.

2. Violations of this code are hereby declared to be public nuisances.

3. A violation of this code constitutes a misdemeanor/infraction punishable by a fine of
$1,000 or by imprisonment in the County jail for six months, or both.

4. In addition to other remedies provided by this ordinance or by other law, any violation
of this ordinance may be remedied by a civil action brought by the District, including, for
example, administrative or judicial nuisance abatement proceedings, other legally
authorized enforcement proceedings, and suits for injunctive relief.

Section 1132.4 Violation Penalties of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:



Section 1132.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor/infraction. The first citation within a 12-month period, for
violations of the Fire Code and any amendments adopted herein shall be treated as a Civil
Penalty payable directly to the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District and is set at $250.00
plus the actual costs of all inspections required to gain compliance at the current rate set by
the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District, per hour with a 1 hour minimum. Said civil
penalties shall be a debt owed to the District by the person responsible for the violation
within thirty (30) days after the date of mailing of the citation unless an appeal is filed as
provided in this section. Upon failure to pay the civil penalty when due, the responsible
person shall be liable in a civil action brought by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District
for such penalty and costs of the litigation, including reasonable attorney’s fees.

Any subsequent citations within a twenty-four (24) month period for any violations of the
Fire Code and any amendments adopted herein shall be misdemeanors/infractions, and
shall be subject to the penalties set forth herein, or a civil penalty shall be assessed in the
sum of $500.00 plus the actual costs of all inspections required to gain compliance at the
rate set from time to time by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District. The imposition
of a penalty for any violation shall not excuse the violation or permit it to continue and all
such persons shall be required to correct or remedy such violations or defects within a
reasonable time When not otherwise specified, each day that a violation occurs or
continues, after a final notice has been delivered shall constitute a separate offense. The
application of both penalties shall be held to prevent the enforced correction of prohibited
condition. Nothing contained in this Section shall be construed or interpreted to prevent
the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District from recovering all costs associated with a Fire
District.

Any violation of any provision of this Chapter shall constitute a public nuisance and shall
entitle the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District to collect the costs of abatement and
related administrative costs by a nuisance abatement lien as more particularly set forth in
Government Code Section 38773.1, and by special assessment to be collected by the
County Tax Collector as more particularly set forth in Government Code Section 38773.5.
At least thirty (30) days prior to recordation of the lien, or submission of the report to the
Tax Collector for collection of this special assessment, the record owner shall receive
notice from the Chief of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District of the intent to charge
the property owner for all administrative costs associated with enforcement of this
Ordinance and abatement of the nuisance. The notice shall include a summary of costs
associated with enforcement of this Ordinance and abatement of the nuisance. The property
owner may appeal the Chief’s decision to the Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-
Calpella Fire District within fifteen (15) days of the date of the notice and request a public
hearing prior to recordation of the lien or submission of the report to the County Tax
Collector for collection of the special assessment. In addition to the foregoing, the
Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District is authorized to prosecute a civil action to collect
such abatement costs from the property owner or other person in possession or control of



the affected property, and shall be entitled to recover such abatement costs, together with
the cost of litigation, including reasonable attorney’s fees.

Any person receiving a citation for a civil penalty pursuant to Section 112.3, Violation
Penalties of Chapter 1, may file an appeal per Section 111.4 through 111.4.7 of this code
against imposition of the civil penalty or response costs and expense.

Section 1143.4 Failure to Comply of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 1143.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform
to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine payable directly to the
Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District set at not less than $250.00 or more than $1000.00
plus the actual costs of all inspections required to gain compliance at the rate set from time
to time by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District. This civil penalty shall be a debt
owed to the District by the person responsible for the violation within thirty (30) days after
the date of mailing of the citation unless an appeal is filed as provided for in Section
112.508:4.




Part 3. RESERVED

Part 4. Upon its effective date, this Ordinance shall supersede any and all previous ordinances
adopting earlier versions of the California Fire Code and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances
in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Part 5. That if any part, subpart, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any reason,
held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of



this Ordinance. The Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District hereby
declares that it would have passed this Ordinance, and each part, subpart, clause or phrase thereof,
irrespective of the fact that any one or more parts, subparts, sentences, clauses and phrases be
declared unconstitutional.

Part 6. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred,
or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed
as cited in Part 4 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be
lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance.

Part 7. That the Fire Chief of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District is hereby ordered and
directed to cause a notice of this Ordinance to be published in a newspaper in general circulation
in accordance with Section 6066 of the California Government Code. Within fifteen (15) days
after adoption, the Fire Chief of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District shall also post in the
office of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District, a certified copy of the full text of this
Ordinance along with the names of those Board of Directors members voting for and against this
Ordinance.

Part 8. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters
established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force upon ratification by the County
of Mendocino pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7(c). adeption-by-the-Redwood
Valey-CalpelaFireDistrict-board-of Directors: This Ordinance shall remain in full force and

effect until a subsequent superseding ordinance becomes effective.

Part 9. The Fire Chief, Chief Officers, Fire Marshal, Deputy Fire Marshal, Fire Code Official, and
Fire Inspectors shall have authority to arrest or to cite any person who violates any provision of
this Ordinance involving the Fire Code or the California Building Standards Code regulations
relating to fire and panic safety as adopted by the State Fire Marshal, in the manner provided for
the arrest or release on citation and notice to appear with respect to misdemeanors or infractions,
as prescribed by Chapters 5, 5¢ and 5d of Title 3, Part 2 of the California Penal Code, including
Section 853.6, or as the same hereafter may be amended. It is the intent of the Board of Directors
of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District that the immunities provided in Penal Code Section
836.5 be applicable to aforementioned officers and employees exercising their arrest or citation
authority within the course and scope of their employment pursuant to this Ordinance.




Part 10. The Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District finds adoption of
this Ordinance is exempt from the California Environmental Quality Act (“CEQA”) under
California Code of Regulation, Title 14, Chapter 3, Article 5, § 15061(b)(3).

The foregoing Ordinance 20253-2% was read and introduced at a regular meeting of the Board of
Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District held on xx34/xx18/xxxx2622. A second
reading/adoption occurred at regular board meeting held on xx3/xx09/xxxx2023 and was adopted
and ordered passed to print by the following vote, to wit:

AYE NAY ABSENT

DIRECTOR Dunken JOHN-STRANGIO—
DIRECTOR Mayfield JAMESTFYSO
DIRECTOR Odell CHRISHNEBOYD
DIRECTOR Tuso FONY-HOWARD
DIRECTOR Cooper SFEPHANIE-DUNKEN

— John-StrangieStephanie Dunken ,

Chair

ATTEST:
Jessica Keizer, Clarke



ATTACHMENT 1l

ORDINANCE NO. 2025-2

AN ORDINANCE OF THE REDWOOD VALLEY-CALPELLA FIRE DISTRICT
ADOPTING THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE PART 9 WITH
AMENDMENTS, AS WELL AS THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE, PART 7, REGULATING AND GOVERNING
THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION
AND FOR PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS, REPEALING ALL
OTHER ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF ORDINANCES OF THE REDWOOD VALLEY-
CALPELLA FIRE DISTRICT IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

The Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District does ordain as follows:

Part 1. That the California Fire Code, 2025 edition, including Appendix Chapter 4 and Appendices
B, BB, C,CC,D, E F G, H, I, K, N, and O as published by the International Code Council, as
well as the 2025 edition of the California Wildland-Urban Interface Code (WUI), including
Appendix A, B, and F as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted
as the Fire Code of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District in the State of California regulating
and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from
the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided,;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of
the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof,
as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any,
prescribed in Part 2 of this Ordinance.

Part 2. That the following sections of the 2025 edition of the California Wildland-Urban Interface
Code are hereby amended and changed in the following respects:

Section 101.1 Title of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the California Wildland-Urban Interface
Code of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section 103.1 Creation of agency. The Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District is hereby
created, and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the Fire Code Official. The
function of this agency shall be the implementation, administration, and enforcement of
the provisions of this code.

That the following sections of the 2025 edition of the California Fire Code are hereby amended
and changed in the following respects:

Section 101.1 Title of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:



101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Redwood Valley-Calpella
Fire District, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section 105.1 General of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
105.1 General. Permits shall be in accordance with Sections 105.1.1 through 105.7.25 or
other provisions of this code as required by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District.

Section 112 Board of Appeals Established of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
112.1 Board of Appeals Established. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders,
decisions or determinations made by the fire code official relative to the application and
interpretation of this code, there shall be and is hereby created a Board of Appeals. The
Board of Appeals shall be the Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire
District or a sub-committee as appointed by the Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-
Calpella Fire District. The fire code official shall be an ex-officio member of said board
but shall have no vote on any matter before the board. The board shall adopt rules of
procedure for conducting its business, and shall render all decisions and findings in writing
to the Appellant with a duplicate copy to the fire code official.

Section 112.3 Qualifications of Chapter 1 is deleted.

Section 112.5 Appeals Process of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

112.5 Appeals Process. The appeals process for appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the fire code official relative to the application and interpretation
of this code shall be defined by sections 112.5.1 through 112.5.5.

Section 112.5.1 Initiating Appeal of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

Section 112.5.1 Initiating Appeal. Any beneficially interested party has the right to
appeal the order served by the fire code official by filing a written “NOTICE OF APPEAL”
with the office of the fire code official within ten days after service of such order and upon
payment of the sum of $150. In the event the order of the fire code official is overturned
following the appeal, the fee shall be returned. The notice shall state the order appealed
from, the identity and mailing address of the Appellant, and the specific grounds upon
which the appeal is made.

Section 112.5.2 Stay of Order of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

Section 112.5.2 Stay of Order. The timely filing of a properly completed notice of appeal
shall have the effect of staying the implementation of the order appealed from until the
final decision of the appeal. Failure to file a timely notice of appeal waives any right to
further challenge the order of the fire code official. “File” means delivered to the office of
the fire code official at 8481 East Rd, Redwood Valley, California 95470.

Exception: Orders affecting acts or conditions which in the opinion of the fire code
official, pose an immediate threat to life, property, or the environment as a result of panic,
fire, explosion, or release are enforceable when made and are not stayed by the filing of a
notice of appeal.



Section 112.5.3 Hearing of Appeal of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:
Section 112.5.3 Hearing of Appeal. Following is the process for establishing and hearing
appeals:

The Board of Appeals, or the secretary thereof, shall set the matter to be heard at a date
within thirty (30) days of receipt of such notice of appeal. Written notice of the time and
place set for hearing shall be served on the Appellant by first class mail to the mailing
address given in the notice of appeal. A hearing may not be conducted less than 20 days
after notice is given to the applicant. The Board of Appeals may adopt rules governing the
conduct of its hearings. Those rules shall include, at least, the following:

1. The fire code official shall submit evidence at the hearing substantiating his/her
decision. Such evidence may include testimony, fire district, police or other reports of the
incident, witness statements, and other documents. Not less than 10 days prior to the
scheduled hearing, the fire code official must notify the Appellant of the name, address and
phone number of any witness to the violation and furnish Appellant with a copy of any
document the fire code official intends to submit at the hearing. Not less than seven (7)
days prior to the hearing, the Appellant may request the fire code official to produce at the
hearing any witness he/she intends to rely upon to substantiate the violation. The written
request must name the witness or witnesses who are requested to attend the hearing. The
fire code official may not rely on the testimony of any witness (including such testimony
contained in reports or written witness statements) whose appearance at the hearing is
required by this subsection, if that witness fails to appear.

2. Not less than 10 days prior to the hearing, the Appellant must notify the fire code official
in writing of the name, address and phone number of any witness the Appellant intends to
call as a witness at the hearing, provide a brief description of the proposed testimony, and
furnish the fire code official with a copy of any document the Appellant intends to offer as
evidence at the hearing. The Appellant may not call any witness to testify at the hearing
who was not identified as required by this subsection or offer any document as evidence at
the hearing that was not provided to the fire code official as required by this subsection.

3. Atthe hearing, the Appellant may be represented by an attorney, at Appellant’s expense.
Both the fire code official and the Appellant shall have the right to examine and cross-
examine any witness produced at the hearing. The rules of evidence that normally apply
in court shall not apply in a hearing before the Board of Appeals, but it shall only consider
evidence which would be relied upon by reasonable people making an important decision,
and shall disregard evidence which by its nature is unreliable or not credible.

4. The entire hearing shall be electronically or steno graphically recorded. The Board of
Appeals shall base its decision exclusively on the evidence presented at the hearing and
shall issue a written decision, which includes a statement of the relevant facts which it finds
to be true and explains how the facts support its decision. The record of the hearing shall
be preserved for not less than six (6) months after the decision is served on the Appellant.



Section 112.5.4 Hearing Decision of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

Section 112.5.4 Hearing Decision. The chairperson of the Board of Appeals shall issue
the written decision required by subsection 4 of Section 112.4 Hearing of appeal. The
Board of Appeals may issue a decision affirming, modifying or vacating the order of the
fire code official. The decision shall be in writing and shall be served upon the Appellant
by first class mail to the mailing address given in the notice of appeal. The hearing decision
shall include notice of the Appellant’s right to seek review of the decision pursuant to
California Code of Civil Procedure Sections 1094.5 and 1094.6.

Section 112.5.5 Finality of the Decision of the Board of Appeals of Chapter 1 is added
to read as follows:

Section 112.5.5 Finality of the Decision of the Board of Appeals. The decision of the
Board of Appeals shall be the final decision for the District. The Board of Appeals shall
have the power to continue any hearing and may, in its discretion, take the appeal under
submission. The Board of Appeals shall render a decision not later than the seventh (7"
day following the date the matter was taken under submission, and forthwith notify the
interested parties as previously set forth.

Section 112.5.6 Appeal to Superior Court of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:
Section 112.5.6 Appeal to Superior Court. Judicial review of the decision of the Board
of Appeals shall be governed by the Code of Civil Procedure Sections 1094.5 and 1094.6.

Section 112.5.7 Enforcement of Decision of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:
Section 112.5.7 Enforcement of Decision. Unless stayed by a court, any final decision of
the Board of Appeals is effective immediately and may be implemented and enforced by
the District. The remedies provided by this code are cumulative and in addition to any
other remedies available at law or in equity.

1. Causing, permitting, aiding, abetting, or concealing a violation of any provision of this
ordinance shall constitute a violation.

2. Violations of this code are hereby declared to be public nuisances.

3. A violation of this code constitutes a misdemeanor/infraction punishable by a fine of
$1,000 or by imprisonment in the County jail for six months, or both.

4. In addition to other remedies provided by this ordinance or by other law, any violation
of this ordinance may be remedied by a civil action brought by the District, including, for
example, administrative or judicial nuisance abatement proceedings, other legally
authorized enforcement proceedings, and suits for injunctive relief.



Section 113.4 Violation Penalties of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 113.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor/infraction. The first citation within a 12-month period, for
violations of the Fire Code and any amendments adopted herein shall be treated as a Civil
Penalty payable directly to the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District and is set at $250.00
plus the actual costs of all inspections required to gain compliance at the current rate set by
the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District, per hour with a 1 hour minimum. Said civil
penalties shall be a debt owed to the District by the person responsible for the violation
within thirty (30) days after the date of mailing of the citation unless an appeal is filed as
provided in this section. Upon failure to pay the civil penalty when due, the responsible
person shall be liable in a civil action brought by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District
for such penalty and costs of the litigation, including reasonable attorney’s fees.

Any subsequent citations within a twenty-four (24) month period for any violations of the
Fire Code and any amendments adopted herein shall be misdemeanors/infractions, and
shall be subject to the penalties set forth herein, or a civil penalty shall be assessed in the
sum of $500.00 plus the actual costs of all inspections required to gain compliance at the
rate set from time to time by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District. The imposition
of a penalty for any violation shall not excuse the violation or permit it to continue and all
such persons shall be required to correct or remedy such violations or defects within a
reasonable time. When not otherwise specified, each day that a violation occurs or
continues, after a final notice has been delivered, shall constitute a separate offense. The
application of both penalties shall be held to prevent the enforced correction of prohibited
condition. Nothing contained in this Section shall be construed or interpreted to prevent
the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District from recovering all costs associated with a Fire
District.

Any violation of any provision of this Chapter shall constitute a public nuisance and shall
entitle the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District to collect the costs of abatement and
related administrative costs by a nuisance abatement lien as more particularly set forth in
Government Code Section 38773.1, and by special assessment to be collected by the
County Tax Collector as more particularly set forth in Government Code Section 38773.5.
At least thirty (30) days prior to recordation of the lien, or submission of the report to the
Tax Collector for collection of this special assessment, the record owner shall receive
notice from the Chief of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District of the intent to charge
the property owner for all administrative costs associated with enforcement of this
Ordinance and abatement of the nuisance. The notice shall include a summary of costs
associated with enforcement of this Ordinance and abatement of the nuisance. The property
owner may appeal the Chief’s decision to the Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-
Calpella Fire District within fifteen (15) days of the date of the notice and request a public
hearing prior to recordation of the lien or submission of the report to the County Tax
Collector for collection of the special assessment. In addition to the foregoing, the
Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District is authorized to prosecute a civil action to collect



such abatement costs from the property owner or other person in possession or control of
the affected property, and shall be entitled to recover such abatement costs, together with
the cost of litigation, including reasonable attorney’s fees.

Any person receiving a citation for a civil penalty pursuant to Section 112.3, Violation
Penalties of Chapter 1, may file an appeal per Section 111.4 through 111.4.7 of this code
against imposition of the civil penalty or response costs and expenses.

Section 114.4 Failure to Comply of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:

Section 114.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform
to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be liable to a fine payable directly to the
Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District set at not less than $250.00 or more than $1000.00
plus the actual costs of all inspections required to gain compliance at the rate set from time
to time by the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District. This civil penalty shall be a debt
owed to the District by the person responsible for the violation within thirty (30) days after
the date of mailing of the citation unless an appeal is filed as provided for in Section 112.5.

Part 3. RESERVED

Part 4. Upon its effective date, this Ordinance shall supersede any and all previous ordinances
adopting earlier versions of the California Fire Code, and all other ordinances or parts of
ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Part 5. That if any part, subpart, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is, for any reason,
held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of
this Ordinance. The Board of Directors of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District hereby
declares that it would have passed this Ordinance, and each part, subpart, clause, or phrase thereof,
irrespective of the fact that any one or more parts, subparts, sentences, clauses, and phrases be
declared unconstitutional.

Part 6. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred,
or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed
as cited in Part 4 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be
lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance.

Part 7. That the Fire Chief of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District is hereby ordered and
directed to cause a notice of this Ordinance to be published in a newspaper in general circulation
in accordance with Section 6066 of the California Government Code. Within fifteen (15) days
after adoption, the Fire Chief of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District shall also post in the
office of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District, a certified copy of the full text of this
Ordinance along with the names of those Board of Directors members voting for and against this
Ordinance.


















Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District

Equipment Trust Fund (2110)

2025/2026

Rev. Acct# Revenue Desc Rev. Amount [Exp. Acct# Expense Category Exp Amount
4100 Interest 4,000 6280 OES Engine 50,000
7707 Contributions and Donations 0 6231 Duty Officer Replacement 130,000
50% FY Prop. P + Sold Assets 240,000 6291 WT Lease Payment 79,790
Total Transfer from Gen. Fund 244,000 Total Transfer to General Fund 259,790
Fund Balance 338,745.55 Future Capital Expenses 322,956
Grand Total 582,746 582,746
50% of Previous Prop. P Sales Tax 110,215.78 0.00

Previous Sales of Fixed Assets 96,500.00

8/11/2025



COUNTY OF MENDOCINO
FIRE AGENCY FUNDING AGREEMENT

This Agreement (“Agreement”), dated as of , 2025 (the “Effective Date”), is by
and between the COUNTY OF MENDOCINO, hereinafter referred to as "COUNTY", and
REDWOOD VALLEY-CALPELLA FIRE DISTRICT, hereinafter referred to as "FIRE
AGENCY".

WHEREAS, FIRE AGENCY, based in Mendocino County, has been identified to provide the
inhabitants, within Agency Boundaries/Service areas, with fire protection services listed in
California Health and Safety Code section 13862; and

WHEREAS, FIRE AGENCY is authorized by law to provide fire protection services; and

WHEREAS, California Government Code section 26227 provides that the Board of
Supervisors of any county may appropriate and expend money from the general fund of the
county to establish county programs or to fund other programs deemed by the board of
supervisors to be necessary to meet the social needs of the population of the county, including
but not limited to, the areas of health, law enforcement, public safety, rehabilitation, welfare,
education, and legal services, and the needs of physically, mentally and financially
handicapped persons and aged persons; and

WHEREAS, in 1992 the State of California, in response to a severe budget deficit, met its
budget obligation to fund schools by diverting specified amounts of property taxes into an
Education Revenue Augmentation Fund (ERAF). Although this “shift” was intended as a
temporary measure, it remains in effect. This reduced city, county, and some special districts’
(including fire districts) revenue to provide funding for schools, causing an annual revenue
loss to cities and some special districts including fire districts; and

WHEREAS, in November 1993 the voters of California approved Proposition 172 to partially
replace property taxes shifted from local agencies to schools as part of the State’s 1993-94
Budget agreement. This Proposition provides a permanent sales tax for support of local public
safety activities and is provided directly to the County for police protection, prosecution,
corrections, probation, fire protection and/or coastal life guard services; and

WHEREAS, following negotiations with the Mendocino County Association of Fire Districts,
and consistent with California Attorney General 2004 opinion #03-804, beginning in FY 2016-
17, the Board of Supervisors of Mendocino County (the “Board”) authorized a portion of
Proposition 172 revenues to be allotted to recognized local fire agencies within the county;
and

WHEREAS, in March 2020, Mendocino County voters approved Measure D, which imposed
a transient occupancy tax on visitors staying in private campgrounds or recreational vehicle
parks located in unincorporated areas of the County, and also approved Measure E, a non-
binding measure advising the County to allocate the revenues raised by Measure D to
recognized fire agencies; and



WHEREAS, in November 2022, Mendocino County voters approved Measure P, which
imposed a County Essential Services Transactions and Use Tax, to generate revenue to
support general County services and functions including, but not limited to fire protection
services; further, the Board approved Resolution #22-159, which stated that the intended use
of Measure P revenues is for fire protection and prevention services; and

WHEREAS, in any given fiscal year the Board may appropriate funding from its Proposition
172, Measure D or Measure P revenues to certain local fire agencies for support of fire
protection services. Local fire agencies are defined as local government entities or tax exempt
501(c)(3) organizations authorized by California Statutes to provide first response fire, rescue,
and emergency medical services (EMS) public safety services to the general public in
Mendocino County. Additionally, these agencies must (1) participate in the Mutual Aid
Coordinating System (MACS) and have an assigned MACS ID Agency Designator, and (2) be
regularly dispatched by the Emergency 911 dispatch center; and

WHEREAS, on July 29, 2025, the Mendocino County Board of Supervisors approved an
allocation of Measure P, Measure D and Proposition 172 revenues for Quarter 3 of Fiscal Year
2024-2025 to FIRE AGENCY and local fire agencies within the County.

NOW, THEREFORE, the parties agree as follows:

1. COUNTY agrees to grant FIRE AGENCY the amount of Sixty-Eight Thousand Seven
Hundred Seventy-One Dollars and Three Cents ($68,771.03). Exhibit A, attached
hereto and incorporated by this reference, includes worksheet(s) detailing the
allocations of funding sources by COUNTY for Quarter 3 of Fiscal Year 2024-2025.

2. FIRE AGENCY agrees to utilize any of the funds so appropriated, allocated and
disbursed by COUNTY only for the purpose of providing the services listed in Health
and Safety Code section 13860 et seq. (“Services”), and in accordance with the terms
of this Agreement.

3. The term of this Agreement shall be from the Effective Date and shall continue through
June 30, 2030, or the end of the fourth fiscal year following the fiscal year in which the
grant was made (the “Termination Date”).

4. FIRE AGENCY is a separate legal entity from COUNTY with respect to all matters set
forth in this Agreement. Nothing in this agreement is intended nor shall be construed to
create an employer-employee relationship, a joint venture relationship, or to allow
COUNTY to exercise discretion or control over the manner in which FIRE AGENCY
utilizes the funds granted to it. The funds provided to FIRE AGENCY pursuant to this
Agreement are a grant and not a payment for any services provided to COUNTY. The
sole interest of COUNTY is that the funds be used to provide the Services in
accordance with the provisions of Health and Safety Code section13860 et seq.

5. FIRE AGENCY agrees to provide COUNTY with a copy of its budget and revenue and
expenditure detail which includes a clear accounting of where the funding is



appropriated in FIRE AGENCY’s budget and its intended use.

FIRE AGENCY shall maintain a full set of accounting records in accordance with the
Governmental Accounting Standards Board or generally accepted accounting
principles and procedures for all funds received under this Agreement. FIRE AGENCY
agrees to comply with all audit, inspection, record-keeping and fiscal reporting
requirements mandated by COUNTY or the State. The COUNTY shall notify the FIRE
AGENCY of any records it deems in its reasonable judgment to be insufficient. FIRE
AGENCY shall have 15 calendar days from such notice to correct any specified
deficiency in the records, or, if more than 15 days shall be reasonably necessary to
correct the deficiency, FIRE AGENCY shall begin to correct the deficiency within 15
days and correct the deficiency as soon as reasonably possible. FIRE AGENCY must
maintain such records for a period of four years following the Termination Date.

FIRE AGENCY must make available at FIRE AGENCY'’s office for examination at
reasonable intervals and during normal business hours to COUNTY’s representatives,
all books, accounts, reports, files, financial records, and other papers or property with
respect to all matters covered by this Agreement, as well as the financial condition of
FIRE AGENCY in general, and shall permit these representatives to audit, examine,
and make copies, excerpts or transcripts from such records. The COUNTY’s
representatives may make audits of any conditions relating to this Agreement, as well
as the financial condition of FIRE AGENCY in general, throughout the term of this
Agreement and for four (4) years following the Termination Date.

FIRE AGENCY agrees to cooperate and supply any documentation reasonably
necessary for the convenience and information of COUNTY.

FIRE AGENCY must immediately inform COUNTY of any information or complaints
involving criminal fraud, waste, abuse, or other criminal activity in connection with this
Agreement.

As this Agreement is merely for purposes of providing a grant to FIRE AGENCY, the
provisions of this section are intended to apply to the fullest extent permitted by law.
FIRE AGENCY shall indemnify and hold harmless County, its elected officials, officers,
employees, agents, and volunteers against all claims, suits, actions, costs, expenses
(including, but not limited to, reasonable attorney's fees of County Counsel and counsel
retained by County, expert fees, litigation costs, and investigation costs), damages,
judgments, or decrees arising from any Services performed by the FIRE AGENCY, or
by any of FIRE AGENCY’s subcontractors, any person employed under FIRE
AGENCY, or under any subcontractor, or in any capacity, except when the injury or
loss is caused by the sole negligence or intentional wrongdoing of County. FIRE
AGENCY shall also, at FIRE AGENCY’s own expense, defend the County, its elected
officials, officers, employees, agents, and volunteers, against any claim, suit, action, or
proceeding brought against County, its elected officials, officers, employees, agents,
and volunteers, arising from FIRE AGENCY providing the Services, or any of FIRE
AGENCY’s subcontractors, any person employed under FIRE AGENCY, or under any



10.

11.

12.

13.

subcontractor, or in any capacity. The provisions of this section shall survive the
termination, expiration, or cancellation of this Agreement.

FIRE AGENCY shall comply with any and all applicable federal, state and local laws
affecting the services covered by this Agreement.

FIRE AGENCY shall not unlawfully discriminate in employment practices or in the
delivery of services on the basis of race, color, creed, religion, national origin, sex, age,
marital status, sexual orientation, medical condition (including cancer, HIV, and AIDS)
physical or mental disability, use of family care leave under either the Family & Medical
Leave Act or the California Family Rights Act, or on the basis of any other status or
conduct protected by law.

The occurrence of any of the following shall constitute a material default and breach of
this Agreement by FIRE AGENCY:

a. Improper use or reporting of funds provided under this Agreement by FIRE
AGENCY or its employees or agents;

b. Substantial failure by FIRE AGENCY to observe and perform any other provision
of this Agreement;

C. FIRE AGENCY’s (1) filing for bankruptcy, dissolution, or reorganization, or
failure to obtain a full dismissal of any such involuntary filing brought by another
party before the earlier of final relief or 60 days after the filing; (2) making a
general assignment for the benefit of creditors; (3) applying for the appointment
of a receiver, trustee, custodian, or liquidator, or failure to obtain a full dismissal
of any such involuntary application brought by another party before the earlier
of final relief or 60 days after the filing; (4) insolvency; or (5) failure, inability or
admission in writing of its inability to pay its debts as they become due.

COUNTY shall give written notice to FIRE AGENCY of any default by specifying (a) the
nature of the event or deficiency giving rise to the default; (b) the action required to cure
the deficiency, if an action to cure is possible; and (c) a date, which shall be not less
than 30 calendar days from the mailing of the notice, by which such action to cure, if a
cure is possible, must be undertaken. FIRE AGENCY shall not be in default if FIRE
AGENCY cures such default within the specified cure period, or, if such default is not
reasonably capable of cure within the specified period, FIRE AGENCY begins to cure
the default within the cure period and thereafter diligently pursues the cure to
completion.

Upon an event of default that has not been cured by FIRE AGENCY, COUNTY, in its
discretion, may take any of the following actions:

a. Terminate this Agreement, in whole or in part;



14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

b. Demand immediate reimbursement of any funds disbursed under this
Agreement;

C. Bring an action for equitable relief (a) seeking the specific performance by
FIRE AGENCY of the terms and conditions of the Agreement, and/or (b)
enjoining, abating, or preventing any violation of said terms and conditions,
and/or (c) seeking declaratory relief;

d. Bar FIRE AGENCY from future funding by COUNTY; and/or
e. Pursue any other remedy allowed at law or in equity.

No waiver of a breach, failure of any condition, or any right or remedy contained in or
granted by the provisions of this Agreement shall be effective unless it is in writing and
signed by the party waiving the breach, failure, right or remedy. No waiver of any
breach, failure, right or remedy shall be deemed a waiver of any other breach, failure,
right or remedy, whether or not similar, nor shall any waiver constitute a continuing
waiver unless the writing so specifies.

This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement between COUNTY and FIRE
AGENCY relating to the COUNTY’s grant of funds made in section 1 of this Agreement.
As used herein, Agreement refers to and includes any documents incorporated herein
by reference and any exhibits or attachments. This Agreement supersedes and merges
all previous understandings, and all other agreements, written or oral, between the
parties and sets forth the entire understanding of the parties regarding the COUNTY’s
grant of funds made in section 1 of this Agreement. This Agreement may not be
modified except by a written document signed by both parties.

Both COUNTY and FIRE AGENCY have the right to terminate this Agreement without
cause at any point in time upon giving written notice to the other. Such notice may be
issued by any COUNTY officer authorized to execute or amend this Agreement, the
COUNTY Chief Executive Officer, or any other person designated by the COUNTY
Board of Supervisors. Except as provided in sections 12 and 13 of this Agreement, in
the event that COUNTY terminates this Agreement, such termination shall not affect
amounts disbursed by COUNTY prior to the date of termination. The obligations of this
Agreement, which by their nature would continue shall survive the termination,
expiration, or cancellation of this Agreement.

This Agreement contains all the terms and conditions agreed upon by the parties that
pertain to the appropriation of Proposition 172, Measure D or Measure P revenues by
COUNTY to FIRE AGENCY.

NOTICES: All notices, requests, demands, or other communications under this
Agreement shall be in writing. Notices shall be given for all purposes as follows:

Personal delivery: When personally delivered to the recipient, notices are effective on



19.

20.

delivery.

First Class Mail: When mailed first class to the last address of the recipient known to
the party giving notice, notice is effective three (3) mail delivery days after deposit in a
United States Postal Service office or mailbox. Certified Mail: When mailed certified
mail, return receipt requested, notice is effective on receipt, if delivery is confirmed by
a return receipt.

Overnight  Delivery: When delivered by overnight delivery (Federal
Express/Airborne/United Parcel Service/DHL WorldWide Express) with charges
prepaid or charged to the sender’s account, notice is effective on delivery, if delivery is
confirmed by the delivery service.

Facsimile transmission: When sent by facsimile to the facsimile number of the recipient
known to the party giving notice, notice is effective on receipt, provided that, (a) a
duplicate copy of the notice is promptly given by first-class or certified mail or by
overnight delivery, or (b) the receiving party delivers a written confirmation of receipt.
Any notice given facsimile shall be deemed received on the next business day if it is
received after 5:00 p.m. (recipient’s time) or on a non-business day.

Addresses for purpose of giving notice are as follows:

COUNTY: COUNTY OF MENDOCINO
Executive Office
501 Low Gap Road, Room 1010
Ukiah, CA 95482

FIRE AGENCY: Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District
P.O. Box 395
Redwood Valley, CA 95470
Attn: Dan Grebil

Any correctly addressed notice that is refused, unclaimed, or undeliverable because
of an act or omission of the party to be notified shall be deemed effective as of the
first date that said notice was refused, unclaimed, or deemed undeliverable by the
postal authorities, messenger, or overnight delivery service.

Any party may change its address or facsimile number by giving the other party notice
of the change in any manner permitted by this Agreement.

Any dispute between the Parties, and the interpretation of this agreement, shall be
governed by the laws of the State of California. Any litigation shall be venued in
Mendocino County.

If any claim for damages is filed with FIRE AGENCY or if any lawsuit is instituted
concerning FIRE AGENCY’s compliance with the terms of this Agreement and that in



21.

22.

23.

any way, directly or indirectly, contingently or otherwise, affects or might reasonably
affect COUNTY, FIRE AGENCY shall give prompt and timely notice thereof to County.
Notice shall be prompt and timely if given within 30 days following the date of receipt
of a claim or 10 days following the date of service of process of a lawsuit. This provision
shall survive the termination, expiration, or cancellation of this agreement.

If a court of competent jurisdiction holds any provision of this Agreement to be illegal,
unenforceable, or invalid in whole or in part for any reason, the validity and
enforceability of the remaining provisions, or portions of them, will not be affected,
unless an essential purpose of this Agreement would be defeated by the loss of the
illegal, unenforceable, or invalid provision.

It is agreed and understood by the parties that this Agreement has been arrived at
through negotiation and that neither party is to be deemed the party which created any
uncertainty in this agreement within the meaning of section 1654 of the Civil Code.

FIRE AGENCY shall at all times during the term of this Agreement maintain in force
sufficient insurance policies to cover liability and loss that pertain to the expenditure
and use of the grant funds under this Agreement and the Services provided by FIRE
AGENCY.



IN WITNESS WHEREOF
DEPARTMENT FISCAL REVIEW:

By:

FIRE AGENCY NAME
By:

DEPARTMENT HEAD

Date:

Budgeted: [X] Yes [ |No
Budget Unit: 2610

Line Items: Measure D: FSC — 86-3113
Measure P: FSP — 86-3113
Prop 172: MS — 86-3113

Grant: [ ] Yes [X] No

Grant No.: N/A

INSURANCE REVIEW:

By:
Risk Management

Date:

EXECUTIVE OFFICE/FISCAL REVIEW:

By:

Deputy CEO or Designee

Date:

Name:

Date:

NAME AND ADDRESS OF FIRE AGENCY:

Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District
P.O. Box 395
Redwood Valley, CA 95470

By signing above, signatory warrants and
represents that he/she executed this Agreement in
his/her authorized capacity and that by his/her
signature on this Agreement, he/she or the entity
upon behalf of which he/she acted, executed this
Agreement

COUNTY COUNSEL REVIEW:
APPROVED AS TO FORM:
Charlotte Scott,

County Counsel

By:
Deputy

Date:

Signatory Authority: $0-25,000 Department; $25,001- 50,000 Purchasing Agent; $50,001+ Board of Supervisors

Exception to Bid Process Required/Completed [] N/A

Mendocino County Business License: Valid []
Exempt Pursuant to MCC Section: Fire District




Measure P %™ ire Funding Allocations ™!

EXHIBIT A

updated: 6/23/2025

S 43;000600,000000 : s:; :vml = ized Bu:s:t Projection I 2024-25 SO N Funding basis: ~ Mendocino County, 2022 Ballot Measure P,
m nsus Count ulation :
ot 0% Toral Fire Agencies Budges partion i R4 .25% Sales Tax (sunsets 3/31/2033), and BOS Resolution #22-159
400,000 € 10% Total MC Fire Safe Council Budget portion
22 & agencies® Qtr 1 (1wozesy " Qtr 2 snany Qtr 3 (wau Qtr 4 (truew) TOTALS to Date
QTR Meas P Actual Revenues & 1,270,463.13 1,274,057.93 1,041,798.69 3,586,319.75
[AUDITOR's reported FY Total] >
QTR 90% Fire Agencies portion & 1,143,416.82 1,146,652.13 937,618.82 3,227,687.77
QTR 10% Fire Safe Council portion ¥ 127,046.31 127,405.80 104,179.87 358,631.98

3 [Bosic s0% | _Pop o ] [Basic 30% | _pop 60% ] Bosic 40% | _Pop 60% ] [ Basicaox | ropeon ]
‘.5 QTRgrossBasic & Popalloc = 457,367 686,050 1,143,416.81 458,661 687,991 1,146,652.13 375,048 562,571 937,618.82 1,291,075 1,936,613  3,227,687.76
8 QTR per Agency &per capita 9 20,789 7.49 20,848 7.5 17,048 6.14 58,685  21.14
H——— TS [ eosic [ropuiouon] TOTAL || Basic [papuenion] _TOTAL | [ Basic | ToTAL ] [ Basic | [ 7oral_][ Bas ] [ voras__|
+ Albion-Littie River FPD en sm 20,789 10837 3162676 20,848 10868  31,71626 = 17048 8887 2593441 58685 30,592 83,277.43
+ Anderson Valley CSD am vew 20789 23,884 4467355 20848 23952 4479996 17,048 19585 3663298 58685 67,421 126,106.49
+ Brooktrails CSO sem s 20789 26086 4687548 20,848 26,160  47,00812 17048 21391 3843859 58685 73,637 132,322.19
+ Comptche CSD = oss 20789 3902 2469144 20,848 3513 2476131 17048 3200 2024735 SBE8S 11,015 69,700.10
+ Covelo FPD ira om 20,789 20596 4138564 20848 20655 4150275 17,048 16889 3393684 58685 58,140 116,825.23
+ ElkCSD m  can 20789 2921 2371031 20848 299 2377740 17,048 2395 1944281 58,685 8,245 66,930.52
1|Fort Bragg ity FD Fort Brogg Ta3 20,789 20,848 17,048 58,685
+|Fort Bragg Rurs!£PD sive aurharyt] 1 ™|{ 20780 14639 | 1se21754 || oo, | 114963 | aseesesy || | sac0s | 12830071 aces | 323607 440,977.82
+ Hopland FPD s L 20,789 14,717 3550635 20,848 14,759 3560682 17,048 12068 2911573 SB685  4L544 100,226.90
w Leggett Valley FPD w osw 20789 3453 2424207 20848 3462 2431067 17048 2831 1987886 58,685 9,746 68,431.60
u Little Lake FPD (Wiliits) wm wes 20789 68571 8935994 20848 68765 8961279 17,048 56229 7327648 58685 193,564 252,249.21
 Long Valley FPD (Laytonville) soe e 20789 19278 4006748 20848 19333  40,180.86 17,048 15808  32,85593 58685 54,419 113,104.27
« Mendocino FPD ;ae aaw 20789 21330 4211962 20848 21391 4223880 17048 17491 3453871 58685 60,212 118,897.13
« Piercy FPD wm o 20,789 981 2177052 20848 984 2183212 17,048 805 17,852.15 58,685 2,770 61,454.79
« Potter Valley CSD e e 20789 14837 3562618 20,848 14879 3572699 17048 12166 2921400 58685 41,882 100,567.17
» Redwood Coast FPD 1m wew 20789 13391 3418070 20,848 13429 3427742 17048 10981 2802868 58685 37,802 96,486.80
v Redwood V-Calpelia FD nm 1 20789 53221 7401011 20,848 53371 7421953 17048 43642 6068940 58685 150,234 208,919.04
w South Coas%PD um tee 20789 13309 3409831 20,848 13347 3410480 17048 10514 2796112 58,685 37,569 96,254.23
ORI City F Uklah Volley | wws 20, 20,848 7 685
| Ukiah Valiey FPD e A ] [y s 20,789 256,457 298,036.13 20,848 257,183 298,879.31 17,048 210299 244,394.07 58,685 723,938 841,309.51
« Westport VFC w  oan 20,788 2082 287148 20848 2,088 2203620 17,048 1707 1575495 58,685 5877 5456263
» Whale Guich VFC s i 20789 1558  22347.21 20848 1562 2241045 17048 1277 1832505 58,685 4,397 63,082.71

Hrcason menest wdk LVIA of- cets 1o Selence e bticated] 9 02470 0,119% 02105 a.5778

Totals: [onae | oo ][ 457,367] 586,050 1,143,416.82| [ 458,661 ] 687,991 [ 1.146,652.13] [ 375,047] 562,571 | 937,618.82 | | | |[1291075] 1936612 3.227.687.77 |
Percent of quanerly funding: 40% 60% 40% 60% 40% 60% 40% 60% 0.00

NOTES:

1) Meas P allocations above are based on a MCAFD funding formula aporoved 6/15/2022 with 3 80% basic allocation shared equally by fire agencies including Citles, remaining 60% allocated by population
2) Bagan with quarterly allocation/distribution format starting with Q4 FY 2022/23
1) Fire Safe Council authorized to receive 10% and Fire Agencies 50% of allocated funding based on BOS resolution '22-155
4) Agency population numbers adjusted to match County's 2020 Census total, each agency increased by same 3.96% over previcusly agreed upon agency and County numbers (98,113 10 52,601} - per 2022 MCAED agresment
5) Because Meas P.25% sales tax applies uniformly throughout afl areas of the Courty, jointly-run Fort Bragg and Ukiah JPA's each include 2 saparate agencies and are eligible to receive 2 hasic aliotments.

Fem - MCAFD Mes # Aocatiom

Tof1

by.

&L

printed: 6/24/202%



Measure D (r

EXHIBIT A

" Fire Funding Allocations ™

N2

QUARTERLY Calcs ¥

updated:  6/23/2025

Funding basis: Mendocino County, 2020 Ballot

Measures D & E, 10% TOT on Campgrounds and RV Parks

in_unincorporated areas

$ 505,000 € BOS FY Budgeted Annual Projection ... 2024-25
378,750 € 75% Fire Agencies minimum portion “/*
126,250 € 25% Fire Chiefs maximum recommendation portion
20 € Agencies™ | Qtrlimum | I Qtr 2 s Qtr 4 e | YTD QTRS I
QTR Meas D Actual Revenues & 191,880.82 164,499.04 66,665.87 423,045.73
[AUDITOR's reported FY Total] <
QTR Fire Chiefs percent 25% 25% 25%
QTR Fire Chiefs allocation 47,970.20 41,124.76 16,666.46 105,761.42
g QTR Fire Agencies NET allocation =  143,910.62 123,374.28 49,999.41 317,284.31
g QTR Net per Agency 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.22
H District/Agency IPA Allocations || Allocations || Allocati || Attocati TOTALS |
1 Albion-Little River FPD 7,185.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
: Anderson Valley CSD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,455.97 15,864.21
> Brooktrails CSD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,455.97 15,864.21
« Comptche CSD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,495.97 15,864.21
= Covelo FPD 7,185.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
¢« Elk CSD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
Fort Bragg City FD Fort Bragg 15,864.21
+|Fort Bragg Rural FPD Fire Authority ¥ 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499,97
* Hopland FPD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
* Leggett Valley FPD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
w Little Lake FPD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
= Long Valley FPD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
= Mendocino FPD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
o Piercy FPD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
“ Potter Valley CSD 7,185.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
= Redwood Coast FPD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,495.57 15,864.21
# Redwood V-Calpella FD 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
= South Coast FPD 7,185.53 6,168,71 2,499.97 15,864.21
Ukiah City FD Ukiah Valley
u|Ukiah Valley FPD Fire Authority 7,185.55 6,168.79 2,499.98 IAANE
= Westport VFC 7,195.53 6,168.71 2,495.97 15,864.21
» Whale Gulch VFC 7,185.53 6,168.71 2,499.97 15,864.21
(Luncation muanuel o8 UVEA o/ cans 10 balinte i iedicated] P 0.0200 0.0800 0.0100 0.1
Totals: 143,910.62 || 12337428 || 49,999.a1 || || 317,284.31 |
Proportion of total budgeted funding: 28.5% 24.4% 9.9% 62.8%
NOTES:

Frm - MCAFD Meas D (TOT) Aliocations.

1) Meas D allocations follow & funding formula detailed In voter-approved Meas £ in place since 2021-22. {Funding source 1 a general fund TOT tax on campgrounds and RV Parks outside of Incorporated Cities that aren't eligible to recelve basic allocations. )

2} 2020 Voter advisory Meas E recommended TOT 75% revenue allocations shared equally among agencies and remaining ~25% to be allocated based on Chiefs Assoc r d
3) TOT current year calcs based on MCFCA 11-9-2022 vote [75% to be distributed to agencies, 25% holdback - reserve fund)

4) Converted to quarterly distribution format in FY 2023-24

1of 1

10

(the "holdb.

™

. E/[ N

printed: 6/24/2025



[ EXHIBIT A

v revision date:  6/23/2025
Prop 172 Fire Funding Allocations QUARTERLY Calcs @ 2024-25 Prop 172
400,000 FY BOS Budget Annual Projection ... 2024-25 c
. l(; 000 : Basic (FD(EdI:)e:Ilotment er;en € 2020 Census County Population ! Funding basis: Mendocino County Board of Supervisars
Ui - g "
J pe ':V L tyPop letter - May 26,2016 "Proposition 172 Funds
200,000 4= Agencies Total Basic all )
i (@)
20 € Agencies Otr 1 (1202 Qtr 2 (siecay Qtr 4 (e TOTAL QTRS to Date
QTR Re derived Allocation & 96,299.66 101,862.56 89,724.65 287,886.87
[AUDITOR's reported FY Total] >
QTR Funds Allocated < 96,299.66 101,862.56 89,724.65 287,886.87
.
3 QTR gross Basic & Pop alloc = 55,000 41,300 96,299.66 55,000 46,863 101,862.56 50,000 39,725 89,724.65 160,000 127,887 287,886.87
§ QTR per Agency & per capita 2,750 0.45 2,750 0.51 2,500 0.43 8,000 140
“| pistrict/agency JPA__ [rop "] % |[ Basic |population] TOTAL |[ asic | | TOTAL || Basic |population] TOTAL || Basic | | T1OTAL || Basic | Popuiation| TOTALS |
+ Albion-Little River FPD w1 2750 652 3,402.40 2,750 740 3,490.27 2,500 628 3,127.52 8,000 2,020  10,020.19
: Anderson Valley CSD as iem 2750 1,438 4,187.80 2,750 1631 438147 2500 1,383 388297 8,000 4,452 1245224
» Brooktrails CSD sas w2750 1570 432036 2,750 1782 453188 2500 1510  4,010.47 8,000 4,863  12,862.71
« Comptche CSD s oasm 2,750 235 2,984.90 2,750 267 3,016.54 2500 226 2,725.94 8,000 727 8,727.38
+ Covelo FPD 2% jem 2,750 1,240  3,989.87 2,750 1407  4,156.38 2,500 1,193 3,69259 8,000 3,839 11,839.34
« Elk CSD w a<m 2750 176 2,925.83 2,750 200 2,949.52 2,500 169 2,669.13 8,000 544 8,544.48

Fort Bragg City FD Fort Bragg MO

901 651 7 580, X ,137.97 ; ,369.24
6,90 | 9,651.16 ” 831 | 10,580.71 ” z,sool 6,638 | 9,137.9 ” I I ” %000 | 21,370 Izs 69.8 l

2,750 I

+|Fort Brage Rural FPD Fire A vm 2,750

» Hopland FPD 1 1w 2,750 886 3,635.94 2,750 1,005 3,755.28 2,500 852 3,352.16 8,000 2,743 10,743.38

+ Leggett Valley FPD s asm 2,750 208 2957.84 2,750 236 298584 2500 200  2,699.92 2,000 644 8,643.60

= Little Lake FPD (Willits) wse s 2,750 4128 687789 2750 4684 743380 2500 3970 647047 8000 12,782  20,782.26

u Long Valley FPD (Laytonville) am 2em 2,750 13161 391052 2,750 1317  4,066.84 2500 1116  3,616.26 8000 3594 1159362

s Mendocino FPD sa i 2750 1284 403406 2,750 1457  4207.02 2500 1,235 373509 8000 3976 1197617

a Piercy FPD 2 o 2750 59 2809.06 2750 67 2817.00 2500 57 2,556.81 8,000 183 8,182.88

« Potter Valley CSD wa 2w 2,750 893 364316 2750 1013 3,76346 2500 859  3,359.10 8000 2,766  10,765.72

u Redwood Coast FPD 1 195 2,750 806 3,556.14 2,750 915 3,664.73 2,500 775 3,275.40 8,000 2,496 10,496.27

« Redwood V-Calpella FO ne 77 2,750 3204 595384 2,750 3635 638538 2500 3,082 558166 8000 9921  17,920.88

= South Coast FPD un ise 2,750 801 355118 2,750 909 3,659.10 2500 771 3,270.63 8000 2481 1048091

uﬁll:::s'a‘l\l’:vDFPD m“ = v.m” a7 15439 [ 18,188.60 " 2450 I 17,513] 20,268.10 ” S5 I 14,850 [ 17,349.80 ” | I " 5000 | 47,806 [ ss,sossol

# Westport VFC m aw 2,750 125 287534 2,750 142 289222 = 2,500 121 262056 8,000 388 838812

» Whale Gulch VFC s oamm 2,750 94 284377 2,750 106 285641 2500 90 2,590.20 8,000 29 829038

Ctrumcation marasel sl UNYA +/- T balence e exScatud) 0.090 0.0900 0.0600 024
Totals: [s26m 100% || 55,000 [ 41,300 [ 96,299.66 || 55,000 [ 46,862 [ 101,862.56|| 50,000 [ 39,725 | 89,724.65 || | | || 160,000 | 127,887 | 287,886.87 |
Percent of quarterly funding: 57% 43% 56% 44%
NOTES:

1) Prop 172 allocations abowe are based an a MCAFD funding formula approved 4-20-16 and utilized since fire agency funding began 2016-17. {Funding source i & "public safety” ssles tax and only revenues received by County, not cities.)

2) Converted to quarterly distribution format in FY 2023-24

3) Agency population numbers adjusted to match County’s 2020 Census total, uniformly each agency increased by 3.96% over previous agreed upon agency and County numbers (88,113 to 91,601} - per 2022 agreement

4) Jointly-run Fort Bragg and Ukish (JPA) departments receive a single basic aliotment because Cities receive Prop 172 funds separately. (In 2016-17, Cities were exclued from population allocations. Then Supv McCawen proposed and MCAFD

agreed to include City in2017-18 when BOS offered to raise total funding by 87,000 thereby not reducing other agencies’ proportional allotments from 2016-17 levels.)
6-23-25 6.// =
by: N
Frm - MUASD Prop 217 Flrw Pusding ASuceien 102 1ofl ornt date: £/24/2005

11



RICOH
Propcsal imagine. change.

IMC2510

PRESENTED TO: \ PREPARED BY:
Angelina Paires
Account Manager
Ricoh Digital Services

Redwood Valley Capella
Fire District

SUBMITTED DATE:

RICOH July 15, 2025

imagine. change.



Cover Letter

Dear Dan,

Thanks for your interest in Ricoh Digital Services. | appreciate the opportunity to provide a competitive
proposal for your Multi-Function Printer needs.

| have taken a simple approach to provide the best technology at the lowest price.

I’m proposing a Ricoh 25 page per minute color machine for your business that will scan, print, fax, and
has an internal finisher.

| look forward to discussing the Ricoh solution with you.
Sincerely,

Angelina Paires
Account Manager - SLED

RICOH Digital Services
Angelina.Paires@Ricoh-USA.Com
Cell: 415-691-5554

RICOH USA, Inc.

RICOH

imagine. change. 2



About Ricoh

For over 80 years, Ricoh
has transformed the way
people work with
breakthrough technologies
that help businesses
innovate and grow. Our
focus has always been to
envision what the future will
look like so that we can help
prepare you for success.
Today, that means
improving workplaces using
innovative technologies &
services enabling individuals
to work smarter.

Learn more:
ricoh-usa.com/about-us

Video: Ricoh is empowering
digital workplaces

Ricoh’s team is always
there when we need
them. And they
understand and respect
what we do, so they work
diligently to resolve issues
quickly.

Oregon based
Non-profit Organization

Executive Summary

Current State

Currently using a Ricoh MP2555SP machine that can print 25
pages a minute. Your average monthly volume for last year
1,263 per month. Your current payment is $207.83.

Your current lease has been expired for 3 years.
Goals

» Upgrade to a current device with Ricoh always current
technology.

» Color System to replace the HP printer that you are buying
toner for

» Budget Conscious

» Piggybacking off Omnia Contract (a pre-bid contract that
state and local government often piggyback off of). it's the
agreement you currently use today with us.

Proposed Solution

« IMC2510 configured with internal staple finisher, 2/3 hole
punch, 4 paper trays, Scan, Fax and power filter

* Includes 2.000 black and white copies per month.

* Includes delivery and training



Configuration

Your Configured RICOH IM C2510G Your Chesen Options

[ CasTo]

*Mote: The image is 8 photo realistic illustration of your selected configuration.

DIMENSIONS
WIDTH DEPTH HEIGHT
23.10in 27.60in 47.60in
587mm 70Tmm 1,209mm

Actual dimensions may vary. These are approximate only.

POWER CONSUMPTION (MAIN UNIT)
1200-127V, 60Hz

RICOH

imagine. change. 4



Proposal for Redwood Valley Capella Fire District

RICOH

Leveraging 80+ years of innovation in office technology

Ricoh’s industry leading product line is designed to meet the demands of any of our customer’s
environments. We offer both workgroup multifunctional printers and printers that work seamlessly with our
digital workplace solutions and software to allow our clients to create, share and mange their critical
business information and documents. Redwood Valley Capella Fire District can look forward to these
benefits:

Reliable Ricoh d . Ricoh...wants to be our
eliable Ricon support and service partner and solve our problems. Ricoh is a
straight shooter that has vastly improved our

+ Direct from the manufacturer o .
organization’s information management.

* No agent/dealer middleman
9 Logistics & Transportation Service Provider

in Pennsylvania

RICOH

imagine. change. 5



Investment

Proposed Monthly payment / 60 Months Current Payment
$197.14 $207.83
Savings $11.69

Recommended Lease Term Options

Service
60 Month Lease $197.14 Includes 2,000 Black and White copies overages at
.0088 for color .0573

Included in Monthly Fee

IMC2510 Performance Multifunction Printer (MFP) with Smart Operation Panel
* 4 paper trays, Scan, Print, Fax , internal staple finisher, 2/3 holepunch, and power filter.
* Installation
* Operator training
* Toner, parts and labor included with service

Reservation of Rights—This quote is based upon the information provided by you, and the assumptions made by us in preparing the information contained herein. While
care has been taken to ensure the accuracy of this quote, we make no representations or warranties about the accuracy, completeness or adequacy of the information
contained herein, and shall not be liable for any errors or omissions. We recognize your right to negotiate and approve the terms of any resulting contract and we reserve
the same right. We also acknowledge that all contract terms and conditions must be mutually agreed upon by both of us. This quote is subject to credit approval and valid
for a period of 15 days from the date stated on the cover page. THIS QUOTE IS PROVIDED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND IS NOT, NOR SHOULD IT BE

CONSTRUED AS, AN OFFER TO SELL/LEASE THE GOODS OR SERVICES LISTED HEREIN.

RICOH

imagine. change.



Work toward a sustainable
future

Our commitment to environmental conservation has been woven into the DNA of our
manufacturing, logistics, product use and final disposal processes. With our sustainable
practices, we can help you advance your green initiatives through eco-responsible
procurement, recycling programs, paper reduction and output optimization.

All of our manufacturing facilities worldwide are ISO 14001-certified and support
sustainable environmental management. We have been an ENERGY STAR® partner for
more than 20 years and were designated ENERGY STAR partner of the year for three
years in a row.

Learn more: ricoh-usa.com/environment



















RECEIVED
5 2005

JUL 1
wer®” g s s

e to the Redisoed. Ua}/ey F/re, Sation -
aj bl _boy, Bear was 1 distress.
Bear b(‘)sj Gez:n'\cm Shephekd) haos
fell ottt the bacik Seat nnc/ /,uar
wedaged between bock sealt ord Lt
o ;__,__;_q_Sea-l— AN his tock  He welq h%ed' _9 Pgujrjf
. TJwo gentlemen did ot Sesitate, :
SZz@/D/ACé‘/— Loward. and wos a bl B
Fo” pPut PBear boy or +he back st .

_ That evening ‘Baor boy" wxs taken

4o the vet, Santa Resa . Umﬂor% LA v‘el y
he oas ot acg, oSed woith  cancey .
Rear buu Ctossed 2he ,Ramboco
8r10/7c, and ;s o rUNning free .

Z want +o _Say ThanK You 509 S

i *-w—éb_e, wonder £u)  men woho kel p N

Me.  that aue,nmy B

(' /6 V/c;_/ gam/re7 |

54/77‘ Teremah Juszczak
;éf’ Cairett ,_/ée/zez/* .




AMAZING.




e L

Ysulve o \WOS\ nd T e preciake sou wiove.
o Lo ord s Conn San) o /
IR T Hhe fire DWMM&, T

~ AND | CANNOT THANK YOU ENOUGH.
WM eatfedde tHionle w

I_X\'QZ Bowow-e




	Item  Minutes 07.10.25.pdf
	1.   Opening Business
	X Chair Dunken      X Director Mayfield       X Director Odell     X Director Tuso          Vacant
	Director Mayfield arrived at 6:02PM
	Staff present: Interim Fire Chief Grebil, Jessica Keizer
	2. Public Comment (GC §54954.3)
	Audience member Gizmo Hendersonmade the comment that he appreciated the fuel reduction burns that were done on Highway 101.
	3. Agenda Amendments (GC §54954.2)
	None
	4.  Consent Calendar
	4.1 Minutes: Approve Regular Board Meeting Minutes of June 12, 2025
	4.2 Payroll: Approve Payroll 11 and 12 in the amount of: $42,472.11
	4.3 Expenditures: Approve Expenditures for June in the amount of:
	General Fund with CalCard Details:  $77,284.72
	Director Tuso made a motion, seconded by Director Odell, to approve the consent calendar with minor corrections to 6.5 and 7.1.
	.
	Ayes: Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	5. Special Order of the Day-Discussion/Action
	5.1 -Interview Board of Director Applicants and appoint a director to fill the vacancy created by the resignation of Anne Woida - Discussion/Action
	Community member Joe Cooper wrote a letter of interest that was presented and read. A question-and-answer interview of the prospective candidate was conducted.
	Director Mayfield made a motion to appoint Joe Cooper as a Director to fill the vacancy on the Board seconded by Director Tuso.
	Ayes: Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	Clerk administered the Oath of Office to newly appointed Board Member Joe Cooper. Director Cooper took his seat at the table.
	5.2 Appoint a Vice-Chairperson to fill the vacancy created by the resignation of Anne Woida  -Discussion/Action
	Director Mayfield made a motion to appoint Russ Odell as the new Vice Chair with a second from Director Tuso.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	5.3 Appoint a Director to the Human Resources Ad Hoc Committee - Discussion/Action
	Director Mayfield made a motion to appoint Russ Odell to sit on the Human Resources Ad Hoc Committee with a second from Director Tuso.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6. Action Items –
	6.1 Public Hearing: Waive the Reading and Adoption of Ordinance 2025-01, Designating Fire Hazard Severity Zones (FHSZ) for the Local Responsibility Areas (LRA) of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District - Discussion/Action
	The public hearing began at 6:15 PM and Fire Marshal Keizer gave a recap of last month’s presentation on designating the Fire Hazard Severity Zones for the Local Responsibility areas of Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District.
	Director Odell made a motion to waive the reading and adopt Ordinance 2025-01, Designating Fire Hazard Severity Zones (FHSZ) for the Local Responsibility Areas (LRA) of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District with a second from Director Mayfield.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.2 Review and Approve an Engagement Agreement with PnPCPA for Independent Auditing Services for the Fiscal Year Ending June 30, 2025 - Discussion/ Action
	Director Tuso made a motion to approve the engagement agreement with PnPCPA with a second from Director Odell.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.3 Review and Approve the County of Mendocino Fire Agency Funding Agreement for the Allocation of Measure D True Up for Fiscal Year 2022-2023, Measure P, Measure D and Proposition 172 Revenues for Quarter 2 of Fiscal Year 2024-2025-Discussion/Action
	22/23 Measure D True Up = $20,558.45
	Measure P =     $74,219.53
	Measure D (TOT) =   $  6,168.71
	Proposition 172 =    $  6,385.38
	Director Mayfield made a motion to approve the County of Mendocino Fire Agency funding  agreement for the allocation of Measure D true up for fiscal year 2022-2023, Measure P, Measure D and Proposition 172 Revenues for quarter 2 of fiscal year 2024-20...
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.4 Review and Approve an Amendment to the Fire Chief Job Description (OPM 2.2) - Discussion/Action
	Director Odell made a motion to approve the Fire Chief Job Description (OPM 2.2) as written with a second from Director Mayfield.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.5 Outdoor Warning Siren – Draft Operating Procedure (OPM 3.24) – Discussion/Action
	At the last meeting the Chief was directed by the Board to draft an operating procedure for the outdoor warning siren. After doing some research the Chief discovered a previous policy that was never adopted. The draft presented was a policy that was d...
	7. Board of Directors and Administrative Reports – Information/Discussion
	(No action will be taken on any questions raised by the Board at this time.)
	7.1 Board of Directors Report
	Human Resources Committee (Ad Hoc – Dunken and Odell)-Completed Fire Chief Job Description
	Budget Committee (Standing – Dunken and Odell) Planning to meet the 3rd week of July.
	7.2 Fire Chief Report
	Interim Chief Grebil gave updates on the training schedule along with personnel, volunteer, and fleet status updates.
	7.3 Volunteers Reports (Fire Marshal, Training Officer and Safety Officer)
	It was reported that the state mandated inspections are complete.  Everyone is preparing for the upcoming BBQ fundraiser. Current upcoming training includes wildland interface, driver/operator training, and drafting. PPE has been issued to the Volunte...
	7.4 Volunteer Association Report- The BBQ is coming on June 19, 2025.The joint pancake breakfast hosted with the local 4-H group was a success. The grant for the address signs is winding down, 96
	of the 100 signs have been made. The Volunteers provided the funding for 4 of the 8 sets of structure gear (PPE) that was recently purchased.
	8.  Correspondence – Information
	None
	9. Request for Future Agenda Items
	None
	10.  Closed Session: Government Code §54957
	Closed Session entered into at 7:05PM
	10.1 Interim Fire Chief Performance Review: Government Code §54957
	11.   Open Session reconvened at 7:26PM
	11.1 Report on Closed Session: Government Code §54957.1
	No action was taken in closed session on items 10.1.
	12.  Adjournment at 7:26PM
	There being no further business to come before the Board the meeting   was adjourned at 7:26PM.
	The next Regular Board Meeting will be August 14, 2025 at 6:00PM
	________________________________                              _______________________________
	Stephanie Dunken, Chair                                                      Jessica Keizer, Clerk

	RVCFD Disbursement List 7.25.pdf
	Sheet1

	Cal Card July 2025.pdf
	07.2025

	RVCFD 2025 Red Lined Attachment 1.pdf
	Section 1121.9 Board of Appeals Established of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
	Section 1121.54.5 Finality of the Decision of the Board of Appeals of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

	RVCFD 2025 Clean Attachment 2.pdf
	Section 112 Board of Appeals Established of Chapter 1 is amended to read as follows:
	Section 112.5.5 Finality of the Decision of the Board of Appeals of Chapter 1 is added to read as follows:

	RVF 2025 CFC_WUI Ordinance Intro BOD.pdf
	Recommendation
	Discussion

	Res 2025-06.pdf
	RESOLUTION 2025-6
	BOARD MEMBER DUNKEN
	BOARD MEMBER COOPER
	BOARD MEMBER MAYFIELD
	BOARD MEMBER ODELL
	Stephanie Dunken, Board Chair
	_______________________________

	RVF 2025 SB1205 BOD.pdf
	Recommendation
	Discussion

	Item  Minutes 07.10.25.pdf
	1.   Opening Business
	X Chair Dunken      X Director Mayfield       X Director Odell     X Director Tuso          Vacant
	Director Mayfield arrived at 6:02PM
	Staff present: Interim Fire Chief Grebil, Jessica Keizer
	2. Public Comment (GC §54954.3)
	Audience member Gizmo Hendersonmade the comment that he appreciated the fuel reduction burns that were done on Highway 101.
	3. Agenda Amendments (GC §54954.2)
	None
	4.  Consent Calendar
	4.1 Minutes: Approve Regular Board Meeting Minutes of June 12, 2025
	4.2 Payroll: Approve Payroll 11 and 12 in the amount of: $42,472.11
	4.3 Expenditures: Approve Expenditures for June in the amount of:
	General Fund with CalCard Details:  $77,284.72
	Director Tuso made a motion, seconded by Director Odell, to approve the consent calendar with minor corrections to 6.5 and 7.1.
	.
	Ayes: Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	5. Special Order of the Day-Discussion/Action
	5.1 -Interview Board of Director Applicants and appoint a director to fill the vacancy created by the resignation of Anne Woida - Discussion/Action
	Community member Joe Cooper wrote a letter of interest that was presented and read. A question-and-answer interview of the prospective candidate was conducted.
	Director Mayfield made a motion to appoint Joe Cooper as a Director to fill the vacancy on the Board seconded by Director Tuso.
	Ayes: Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	Clerk administered the Oath of Office to newly appointed Board Member Joe Cooper. Director Cooper took his seat at the table.
	5.2 Appoint a Vice-Chairperson to fill the vacancy created by the resignation of Anne Woida  -Discussion/Action
	Director Mayfield made a motion to appoint Russ Odell as the new Vice Chair with a second from Director Tuso.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	5.3 Appoint a Director to the Human Resources Ad Hoc Committee - Discussion/Action
	Director Mayfield made a motion to appoint Russ Odell to sit on the Human Resources Ad Hoc Committee with a second from Director Tuso.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6. Action Items –
	6.1 Public Hearing: Waive the Reading and Adoption of Ordinance 2025-01, Designating Fire Hazard Severity Zones (FHSZ) for the Local Responsibility Areas (LRA) of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District - Discussion/Action
	The public hearing began at 6:15 PM and Fire Marshal Keizer gave a recap of last month’s presentation on designating the Fire Hazard Severity Zones for the Local Responsibility areas of Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District.
	Director Odell made a motion to waive the reading and adopt Ordinance 2025-01, Designating Fire Hazard Severity Zones (FHSZ) for the Local Responsibility Areas (LRA) of the Redwood Valley-Calpella Fire District with a second from Director Mayfield.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.2 Review and Approve an Engagement Agreement with PnPCPA for Independent Auditing Services for the Fiscal Year Ending June 30, 2025 - Discussion/ Action
	Director Tuso made a motion to approve the engagement agreement with PnPCPA with a second from Director Odell.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.3 Review and Approve the County of Mendocino Fire Agency Funding Agreement for the Allocation of Measure D True Up for Fiscal Year 2022-2023, Measure P, Measure D and Proposition 172 Revenues for Quarter 2 of Fiscal Year 2024-2025-Discussion/Action
	22/23 Measure D True Up = $20,558.45
	Measure P =     $74,219.53
	Measure D (TOT) =   $  6,168.71
	Proposition 172 =    $  6,385.38
	Director Mayfield made a motion to approve the County of Mendocino Fire Agency funding  agreement for the allocation of Measure D true up for fiscal year 2022-2023, Measure P, Measure D and Proposition 172 Revenues for quarter 2 of fiscal year 2024-20...
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.4 Review and Approve an Amendment to the Fire Chief Job Description (OPM 2.2) - Discussion/Action
	Director Odell made a motion to approve the Fire Chief Job Description (OPM 2.2) as written with a second from Director Mayfield.
	Ayes: Cooper, Mayfield, Odell, Tuso, Dunken
	Noes:
	Absent:
	Abstain:
	Motion passes
	6.5 Outdoor Warning Siren – Draft Operating Procedure (OPM 3.24) – Discussion/Action
	At the last meeting the Chief was directed by the Board to draft an operating procedure for the outdoor warning siren. After doing some research the Chief discovered a previous policy that was never adopted. The draft presented was a policy that was d...
	7. Board of Directors and Administrative Reports – Information/Discussion
	(No action will be taken on any questions raised by the Board at this time.)
	7.1 Board of Directors Report
	Human Resources Committee (Ad Hoc – Dunken and Odell)-Completed Fire Chief Job Description
	Budget Committee (Standing – Dunken and Odell) Planning to meet the 3rd week of July.
	7.2 Fire Chief Report
	Interim Chief Grebil gave updates on the training schedule along with personnel, volunteer, and fleet status updates.
	7.3 Volunteers Reports (Fire Marshal, Training Officer and Safety Officer)
	It was reported that the state mandated inspections are complete.  Everyone is preparing for the upcoming BBQ fundraiser. Current upcoming training includes wildland interface, driver/operator training, and drafting. PPE has been issued to the Volunte...
	7.4 Volunteer Association Report- The BBQ is coming on June 19, 2025.The joint pancake breakfast hosted with the local 4-H group was a success. The grant for the address signs is winding down, 96
	of the 100 signs have been made. The Volunteers provided the funding for 4 of the 8 sets of structure gear (PPE) that was recently purchased.
	8.  Correspondence – Information
	None
	9. Request for Future Agenda Items
	None
	10.  Closed Session: Government Code §54957
	Closed Session entered into at 7:05PM
	10.1 Interim Fire Chief Performance Review: Government Code §54957
	11.   Open Session reconvened at 7:26PM
	11.1 Report on Closed Session: Government Code §54957.1
	No action was taken in closed session on items 10.1.
	12.  Adjournment at 7:26PM
	There being no further business to come before the Board the meeting   was adjourned at 7:26PM.
	The next Regular Board Meeting will be August 14, 2025 at 6:00PM
	________________________________                              _______________________________
	Stephanie Dunken, Chair                                                      Jessica Keizer, Clerk




